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  A. T. Block, prominent and wealthy farmer, passed away suddenly at the home of his 
daughter, Mrs. Alvin Zenke, in Broadlands, last Sunday evening at about 9:00 o’clock. 
  Mr. Block had been in failing health for several years, but his recent illness was of only a 
few days duration, having been down town as late as last Friday to look after his business 
affairs.  He had a heavy cold at that time which soon developed into pneumonia and 
caused his death. 
  Uncle Charley, as he was familiarly called by his friends, was a man of great vitality and 
he always kept busy at something even after moving to town. Uncle Charley was criticized 
by some for working so hard after he became aged. But, those who criticized failed to 
realize that Uncle Charley was happiest when he was busy and that is what counts. In 
other words, he lived his life in his own way. 
  Mr. Block was one of the wealthiest men of the community.  Besides his large land 
holdings, he owned a number of dwelling properties and several business houses in the 
village of Broadlands.  Mr. Block did much to build up Broadlands and make it what it is 
today. 
  Short funeral services were held at the home of Alvin Zenjke last Tuesday afternoon at 
1:30, and at the St. John’s Evangelical church, northwest of Broadlands, at 2:00 o’clock.  
Rev. George Gerhold, of Franklin, Ill. A former pastor of the church, had charge of the 
services.  Music was furnished by a quartet composed of Mesdames Emil Schumacher, 
Howard Mohr, Philip Limb and Frank Frick, with Mrs. Walter Witt presiding at the piano.  
The casket bearers were Philip Limp, Karl Partenheimer, John Bahlow, A. S. Maxwell, 
Henry Kilian, Sr., Frank Frick. 
  Burial was in the St. John’s Evangelical cemetery, with Dicks Brothers, local 
undertakers in charge. 
  August Theodore Block, son of John F. and Johanna C. Block was born in Berlin, 
Germany, Oct. 22, 1847.  He came to America with his parents in the year of 1871 at the 
age of 24 years.  His father died the following year and his mother spent the rest of her life 
with him. 
  He was married to Caroline Kagels in 1878.  Their first home was near Sidney.  To this 
union three children were born.  A son who died in infancy, a daughter Hattie Hulda, and a 
son Paul August Block, who preceded him in death in November, 1927. 
  In the year of 1899 he moved on what is known as the Block home place southwest of 
Broadlands. In 1908 he moved to the town of Broadlands, where he spent the rest of his 
life. 
  He was confirmed when a boy in St. John’s Evangelical church and was a faithful 
member all his life. 
  Five years ago, on Dec. 17, 1929, his wife was struck by a train and instantly killed.  
Since them he has made his home with his only daughter. 
  He died after a few days illness of pneumonia, Jan. 6, 1935, at the age of 87 years, 3 
months and 15 days. 



 

 

  He is survived by one daughter, Mrs. Hattie Zenke of Broadlands; three grandchildren, 
Mrs. Maude Luedke, Alfred Zenke, and Mrs. Hilda Seider, all of Broadlands.  Five 
great-grandchildren Jean Paul, Marion and Hope Celestine Zenke, Richard Lloyd Seider, 
and Paul Robert Luedke.  He is also survived by one brother, Albert Block, of Champaign.  
His sister, Ms. Mary Block, preceded him in death in 1923. 
 

 


